



PRICE TABULATION

Purchase of Integrated Pest Management Services for Alamo Colleges District

Item	Location/Address	Services/Frequency		Big M Pest Control Inc.		Pied Piper Pest Control		Worldwide Pest Control, Inc.	
Section A: Scheduled Services									
				Frequency Unit Fee	Annual Fee	Frequency Unit Fee	Annual Fee	Frequency Unit Fee	Annual Fee
A1.	Northwest Vista College, 3535 N Ellison Dr	Interior Cost per Week	49	\$235.00	\$11,515.00	\$155.00	\$7,595.00	\$55.00	\$2,695.00
		Exterior Cost per Month	12	\$940.00	\$11,280.00	\$120.00	\$1,440.00	\$155.00	\$1,860.00
A2.	Westside Education Training Center (WETC) 563 SW 40 th Street	Interior Cost per Week	49	\$40.00	\$1,960.00	\$21.00	\$1,029.00	\$55.00	\$2,695.00
		Exterior Cost per Month	12	\$160.00	\$1,920.00	\$65.00	\$780.00	\$80.00	\$960.00
A3.	San Antonio College (SAC), 1300 San Pedro Avenue	Interior Cost per Week	49	\$350.00	\$17,150.00	\$237.00	\$11,613.00	\$195.00	\$9,555.00
		Exterior Cost per Month	12	\$1,405.00	\$16,860.00	\$150.00	\$1,800.00	\$220.00	\$2,640.00
A4.	St. Philip's College (SPC), 1801 Martin Luther King Drive	Interior Cost per Week	49	\$195.00	\$9,555.00	\$98.00	\$4,802.00	\$55.00	\$2,695.00
		Exterior Cost per Month	12	\$780.00	\$9,360.00	\$105.00	\$1,260.00	\$115.00	\$1,380.00
A5.	St. Philip's College – Southwest Campus (SWC) 800 Quintana Road; Workforce Center of Excellence (WCE) 203 Norton Street	Interior Cost per Week	49	\$235.00	\$11,515.00	\$80.75	\$3,956.75	\$100.00	\$4,900.00
		Exterior Cost per Month	12	\$940.00	\$11,280.00	\$90.00	\$1,080.00	\$220.00	\$2,640.00
A6.	Eastside Education Training Center (EETC), 451 Dietrich Road	Interior Cost per Week	49	\$40.00	\$1,960.00	\$29.00	\$1,421.00	\$55.00	\$2,695.00
		Exterior Cost per Month	12	\$160.00	\$1,920.00	\$65.00	\$780.00	\$55.00	\$660.00

A7.	Northeast Center & Pat Booker Road, Locations (includes Risk Management Bldg.) 7980, 7982, 7990, & 8300 Pat Booker Road	Interior Cost per Week	49	\$156.00	\$7,644.00	\$45.00	\$2,205.00	\$55.00	\$2,695.00
		Exterior Cost per Month	12	\$624.00	\$7,488.00	\$75.00	\$900.00	\$110.00	\$1,320.00
A8.	Northeast Lakeview College (NLC) , 1201 Kitty Hawk Road	Interior Cost per Week	49	\$312.00	\$15,288.00	\$68.00	\$3,332.00	\$110.00	\$5,390.00
		Exterior Cost per Month	12	\$1,248.00	\$14,976.00	\$95.00	\$1,140.00	\$290.00	\$3,480.00
A9.	Palo Alto College (PAC), 1400 W. Villaret Blvd.	Interior Cost per Week	49	\$195.00	\$9,555.00	\$144.25	\$7,068.25	\$165.00	\$8,085.00
		Exterior Cost per Month	12	\$780.00	\$9,360.00	\$105.00	\$1,260.00	\$170.00	\$2,040.00
A10a.	First Responders Academy (FRA), 15775 IH 35 S, Von Ormy, TX	Interior Cost per Week	49	\$40.00	\$1,960.00	\$25.00	\$1,225.00	\$55.00	\$2,695.00
		Exterior Cost per Month	12	\$160.00	\$1,920.00	\$65.00	\$780.00	\$55.00	\$660.00
A10b.	Arachnid Strips	Per Quarter	4	\$400.00	\$1,600.00	\$65.00	\$260.00	\$100.00	\$400.00
A10c.	Snake Prevention	Every 6 Months	2	\$375.00	\$750.00	\$175.00	\$350.00	\$200.00	\$400.00
A11.	District Offices, 811 W. Houston St.	Interior Cost per Week	49	\$40.00	\$1,960.00	\$15.00	\$735.00	\$55.00	\$2,695.00
		Exterior Cost per Month	12	\$80.00	\$960.00	\$45.00	\$540.00	\$55.00	\$660.00
A12.	District Offices, 201 W. Sheridan St.	Interior Cost per Week	49	\$40.00	\$1,960.00	\$20.00	\$980.00	\$55.00	\$2,695.00
		Exterior Cost per Month	12	\$80.00	\$960.00	\$45.00	\$540.00	\$55.00	\$660.00
A13.	Central Texas Technology Center (CTTC), 2189 FM 758, New Braunfels, TX	Interior Cost per Week	49	\$45.00	\$2,205.00	\$22.00	\$1,078.00	\$55.00	\$2,695.00
		Exterior Cost per Month	12	\$160.00	\$1,920.00	\$45.00	\$540.00	\$55.00	\$660.00
A14.	Pest Strips	Per application (24 each)	1	\$400.00	\$400.00	\$65.00	\$65.00	\$88.00	\$88.00
Est. Annual Price Total:					\$187,181.00		\$60,555.00		\$72,693.00
Section B: As Needed Services									
<u>Item</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Services</u>	<u>Est. Quantity</u>	Big M Pest Control Inc.		Pied Piper Pest Control		Worldwide Pest Control, Inc.	
				Frequency Unit Fee	Annual Fee	Frequency Unit Fee	Annual Fee	Frequency Unit Fee	Annual Fee
B1.	Crazy Ants	Per Hour	10	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$50	\$500.00	\$55.00	\$550.00

B2.	Carpenter Ants	Per Hour	10	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$50	\$500.00	\$55.00	\$550.00
B3.	Termites	Per Linear Foot	10	\$6.00	\$60.00	\$5.25	\$52.50	\$2.00	\$20.00
B4.	Bed Bugs	Per Square Foot (Chemical)	10	\$1.50	\$15.00	\$0.70	\$7.00	\$0.38	\$3.80
B5.	Bed Bugs	Per Square Foot (Heat)	10	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.70	\$7.00	No Bid	No Bid
B6.	Brown Recluse / Black Widow	Per Hour	10	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$50	\$500.00	\$55.00	\$550.00
B7.	Wildlife Control	Per Dead Animal Removal	10	\$75.00	\$750.00	\$45.00	\$450.00	\$125.00	\$1,250.00
B8.	Wildlife Control	Per Week (Live Animal Trapping)	10	\$150.00	\$1,500.00	\$50.00	\$500.00	\$85.00	\$850.00
B9.	Snakes	Per Dead Animal Removal	10	\$75.00	\$750.00	\$45.00	\$450.00	\$125.00	\$1,250.00
B10.	Snakes	Per Week (Live Animal Trapping)	10	\$75.00	\$750.00	\$50.00	\$500.00	\$85.00	\$850.00
B11.	Bats	Per Hour (Removal)	10	\$75.00	\$750.00	\$145.00	\$1,450.00	\$65.00	\$650.00
B12.	Birds	Per Time Plus Materials	10	\$75.00	\$750.00	\$100.00	\$1,000.00	\$85.00	\$850.00
B13.	Honey Bees	Per Hour (Removal)	10	No Bid	No Bid	\$45.00	\$450.00	\$65.00	\$650.00
Est. Annual Price Total:					\$192,506.00		\$66,921.50		\$80,716.80
	Price Rank				3		1		2
	Technical Rank				2		1		3
	Overall Rank				3		1		2